9-13-3

9-13-1
CHAPTER 13

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE
SECTION:
9-13-1 Adoption Of Fuel Gas Code
9-13-2 Application
g-13-3 Amendments, Revisions, And Changes
9-13-1: ADOPTION OF FUEL GAS CODE: There is hereby adopted

by the village the international fuel gas code, 2000 edition, as
hereinafter amended (hereinafter the "IFGC"). One copy of the IFGC has
been on file in the office of the village clerk for a period of at least thirty
(30) days prior to the adoption of these provisions and now is and remains
on file in the office of the village clerk, and the same is hereby adopted and
incorporated as fully as if set out at length herein. (Ord. 02001-57,

10-16-2001)

9-13-2: APPLICATION: The IFGC shall apply to all buildings and
struciures within the village to the extent that they are

expressly regulated by the IFGC. (Ord. 02001-57, 10-16-2001)

g-13-3: AMENDMENTS, REVISIONS, AND CBANGES:
Section 403.4.3, Copper and Brass: Delete.
Section 403.4.4, Aluminum: Delete,

Section 403, Metallic Tubing: Delete only seamless copper and aluminum
alloy tubing.

Section 403.5.2, Copper Tubing: Delete.

Section 404.8, Minimum burial depth, remove 12 inches (305 mm) and
replace with 18 inches (457.5 mm).

November 2001
Village of Hinsdale



VILLAGE OF HINSDALE
ORDINANCE NO. 0 2001-57
AN ORDINANCE AMENDING

THE VILLAGE CODE OF HINSDALE
REGARDING BUILDING REGULATIONS SAFETY CODES

WHEREAS, The Village of Hinsdale has in the past adopted national standards for its
building regulations, with appropriate amendments; and

WHEREAS, the Village desires to update its Village Code to reflect updates to the

national standards; and

WHEREAS, the Village Board has determined that the amendments in this Ordinance are

in the best interest of the Village and the public;'
NOW, THEREFORE, BEIT ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the
Village of Hinsdale, DuPage and Cook Counties and State of Iilinois, as follows:

Section 1. Recitals. The foregoing recitals are incorporated into and made a part of this

Ordinance by this reference.

INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE



9-13-3 9-13-3

Section 404.9.1, Individual outside appliances; remove 8 inches (203 mm)
and replace with 18 inches (457.5 mm).

(Ord. 02001-57, 10-16-2001)

November 2001
Village of Hinsdale



